
OCEANA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION 

2024

ANNUAL SUPPLY BID TABULATION



COMPANY NAME
ITEM (Delivered) QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE 
23A Dolomite TON NO BID TON TON $18.00

LUDINGTON
22A Gravel delivered to Hart 52 TON $14.50 52 TON $15.00 TON $18.00
23A Gravel delivered to Hart 52 TON $14.50 52 TON $15.00 TON $18.00

22A Slag deilvered to Hart TON NO BID TON TON $21.45
34CS Slag delivered to Hart TON NO BID TON TON NB

H1 or 32FA Limestone delivered to Hart* TON NO BID TON TON $31.75
8" X 18" Limestone delivered to Hart TON NO BID TON TON $84.00

22A Gravel delivered M20 52 TON $14.50 TON TON $18.00
23A Gravel delivered M20 52 TON $14.50 TON TON $18.00
22A Slag delivered M20 TON NO BID TON TON $22.95
H1 or 32FA Limestone delivered M20* TON NO BID TON TON $32.45
34CS Slag Delivered M20* TON NO BID TON TON NB

Material to be Picked up
2NS (Pit Location) M-20 Pit Any TON $5.50 TON *$6.25 TON NB
22A Gravel (Pit Location) Any TON $9.50 TON **$9.90 TON $18.00
23A Gravel (Pit Location) Any TON $9.50 TON **$9.90 TON $18.00
Pit Location if different than listed above 2040 E 8th St *M20 Pit Ludington, MI

**Hesperia/Baker/M20

Rip-Rap Plain (Pit Location) TON NO BID TON TON
Ludington, MI

Materials Spread Directly Onto Roadway
22A Spread onto North County Road 30 TON $16.50 28 TON $17.50 TON $21.00
22A Slag Spread onto North County TON TON TON $22.95
23A Spread onto North County Road 30 TON $16.50 28 TON $17.50 TON $21.00
22A Spread onto South County Road 30 TON $16.50 28 TON $17.00 TON $21.00
22A Slag Spread onto South County TON TON TON $24.45
23A Spread onto South County Road 30 TON $16.50 28 TON $17.00 TON $21.00

       Call ahead for availability of Products
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Alpine Contracting, LLC Beckman Bros. Inc. Rieth-Riley Construction Co.

AGGREGATES

White Cloud, MI 49349



ITEM (Delivered) QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE
23A Dolomite TON $26.05 TON $26.30 TON

to Hart
22A Gravel delivered to Hart TON $18.75 TON NO BID TON
23A Gravel delivered to Hart TON $18.75 Limestone TON *$26.25 TON

22A Slag deilvered to Hart TON $22.55 TON $23.30 TON
34CS Slag delivered to Hart TON $64.25 TON $45.00 TON

H1 or 32FA Limestone delivered to Hart* TON $33.85 TON $32.92 TON
8" X 18" Limestone delivered to Hart TON $71.50 8" X 16" TON **$85.00 TON

22A Gravel delivered M20 TON $18.50 TON NO BID TON
23A Gravel delivered M20 TON $18.50 TON $26.25 TON
22A Slag delivered M20 TON $22.30 TON $23.30 TON
H1 or 32FA Limestone delivered M20* TON $33.60 TON $32.92 TON
34CS Slag Delivered M20* TON $64.00 TON $45.00 TON

Material to be Picked up
2NS (Pit Location) M-20 Pit TON NO BID TON NO BID TON
22A Gravel (Pit Location) TON NO BID TON NO BID TON
23A Gravel (Pit Location) TON NO BID TON NO BID TON
Pit Location if different than listed above

Rip-Rap Plain (Pit Location) TON NO BID TON $75.00 TON
Nunica Yard

Materials Spread Directly Onto Roadway
22A Spread onto North County Road TON $20.50 TON NO BID TON
22A Slad Spread onto North County TON $24.30 TON $24.75 TON  
23A Spread onto North County Road TON $20.50 Limestone TON *$28.00 TON
22A Spread onto South County Road TON $19.50 TON NO BID TON
22A Slag Spread onto South County TON $23.30 TON $23.50 TON  
23A Spread onto South County Road TON $19.50 Limestone TON *$27.00 TON
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Verplank Trucking Company Yellow Rose Transport  

AGGREGATES



Item Min Qty Unit Unit Price Min Qty Unit Unit Price Min Qty Unit Unit Price
Bit Mix 13A TON $80.00 None TON $78.50 TON

Location Ludington

Bit Mix 36A TON $80.00 None TON $78.50 TON
Location Ludington

Bit Mix Commercial Top TON $80.00 None TON $78.50 TON
Location Ludington

 
Bit Mix Commercial Base TON $80.00 None TON $78.50 TON

Location Ludington

**Prices may not be firm for
 the duration of the bid

CP5 Delivered Hart TON TON N/A TON
CP 7 Delivered Hart TON TON N/A TON

TON $150.00 None TON $130.00 50 TON 147.35**
Pick up Muskegon to Hart** to Hart

50 TON 144.04**
     to M20/New Era

Cold Patch Delivered Hart TON TON TON

**Price not firm for duration of bid
*3UPM cold mix                                * 1CP6-Statite

**Please notify in adavance if possible

Muskegon

Muskegon

Muskegon

*Hi Quality (describe) delivered Hart
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Muskegon

*4UPM cold mix

* 2Bond X Cold Patch   
     Bit Mat Products

BITUMINOUS MIXTURES - HOT & COLD

Asphalt Paving Inc. Rieth - Riley Construction Co. Unique Paving Materials



Item Quantity Unit Unit Price Extension Quanity Unit Unit Price Extension

Treated SYP Bridge Planking
MBF MBM

Timber Box Culvert MBM
Transverse Decking               4", 

6" & 8" MBM
Treated Bridge and Salt 

Timbers MBF MBM
Panelized Bridge Decks, 

Longitudinal to 12" MBM
Panelized Bridge Decks, 

Longitudinal to 14" MBF MBM
Panelized Bridge Decks, 

Logitudinal to 16" MBF MBM
Panelized Bridge Decks, 

Logitudinal to 18" MBM
Panelized Bridge Decks, 

Logitudinal to 20" MBM
Hardware Pound Pound
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BRIDGE DECKS

 



ITEMS Natural (26%-29%) Other 30%-33% 34%-38% Modified 26%-29% 34%-38%

DELIVERED TO TANKS

% OF Calcium Chlorides 19-21%** 32% 38% Boost 28% 35%
% of Total Chlorides N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

F.O.B. Hart Tanks  0.22 /gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F.O.B. M20 Tanks  0.22 /gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

APPLIED TO ROADS
Application rate per mile (2 lane 

road) 2,500 gal/mi 2,000 gal/mi 2,000 gal/mi 2,000 gal/mi
NW quadrant of county 0.34 /gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
NE quadrant of county 0.34 /gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
SW quadrant of county 0.34 /gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
SE quadrant of county 0.34 /gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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**PRICES BASED ON 9500+ GALLON LOAD SIZES   **TERMS: NET 30 DAYS

Brine and Processed Dust Control                   Product Minimum 19% CaCl2
Michigan Chloride Sales, LLC

BRINE



Brine and Processed Dust Control                   Product Minimum 19% CaCl2

ITEMS Natural (26%-29%) Other 30%-33% 34%-38% Modified 26%-29% 34%-38%

DELIVERED TO TANKS $1.159
% OF Calcium Chlorides 19-21% 32% 38% Boost 28% 35%

% of Total Chlorides  38%
F.O.B. Hart Tanks  $0.600
F.O.B. M20 Tanks  $0.616

APPLIED TO ROADS $0.701
Application rate per mile (2 lane 

road) 2,500 gal/mi 2,000 gal/mi 2,000 gal/mi 2,000 gal/mi
NW quadrant of county

NE quadrant of county

SW quadrant of county

SE quadrant of county

Great Lakes Chloride, Inc
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BRINE



Unit Price

ITEM Quantity Unit Alum Extension Quantity Unit Unit Price* Extension Quantity Unit Unit Price Extension

12" - 16 ga CSP ft $11.09 ft $11.97 ft $11.80

15" - 16 ga CSP ft $13.65 ft $14.51 ft $14.16

18" - 16 ga CSP ft $16.35  ft $17.65 ft $17.70

24" - 14 ga CSP ft $26.85 ft $28.73 ft $28.80

30" - 14 ga CSP ft $33.95 ft $36.41 ft $36.00

36" - 14 ga CSP ft $40.95 ft $42.48 ft $43.20
12" - 16 ga CSP Band (12" wide) each $16.65 12" wide each $23.94 each $19.50
15" - 16 ga CSP Band (12" wide) each $20.45 12" wide each $29.02 each $23.50

18" - 16 ga CSP Band 24" Length each $32.70 each $35.30 each $35.50

24" - 14 ga CSP Band 24" Length each $44.00 each $57.46  each $58.00

30" - 14 ga CSP Band 24" Length each $66.00 each $72.82  each $72.00

36" - 14 ga CSP Band 24" Length each $80.00 each $84.96  each $87.00
Minimum Truck Capacity in Pounds N/A N/A

*CSP Unit Price *CSP Unit Price

1% 10 Net 30. Terms Net 30

Prices will remain firm for 60 days
Discount:  
1% Net 10

Pricing is good 30 days from bid date, no delivery 
charge or minmum

Prices include full truck delivery to yard or jobsite. Less 
than truck load quantities, freight charges may apply.  Minimum order to include freight is $7,500.00.  FOB 

Oceana County. Prices firm for 30 days from bid date.  
Less than said amount add $500.
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CULVERTS
ALL PIPE AND BANDS MUST BE ALUMINIZED TYPE 2

Cadillac Culvert Inc. Jensen Bridge & Supply Co. St Regis Culvert Inc. 



NON OPERATED HOURLY DAILY WEEKLY MONTHLY HOURLY DAILY WEEKLY MONTHLY
Excavator, Long Carriage, 40,000#   $625.00 $2,300.00 $6,325.00
Pulverizer, 7' width
Hi-Ranger (describe)
Loader, Articulating, 5-6cyd  $600.00 $2,400.00 $6,600.00
Screen Deck, 3 Products, 400+TPH

OPERATED
Excavator, long Carriage, 40,000#
Pulverizer, 7' width $425.00
Hi-Ranger (describe)
Loader, Articulating, 5-6 cyd $150.00  
Semi Train - (tractor, dump lead, dump pup)
Screen Deck, 3 Products, 400+TPH $155.00
Semi with Dump Lead $120.00

Mill 4' $525.00
Mill 7' $625.00

Trucking (each rental) Add $770.00

Carleton Equipment

EQUIPMENT RENTAL
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Hallack Contracting Inc. 



NON OPERATED HOURLY DAILY WEEKLY MONTHLY HOURLY DAILY WEEKLY MONTHLY
Excavator, Long Carriage, 40,000#
Pulverizer, 7' width
Hi-Ranger (describe)  
Loader, Articulating, 5-6cyd
Screen Deck, 3 Products, 400+TPH

 
OPERATED
Excavator, long Carriage, 40,000# 157.00$    1,736.00$    6,760.00$    25,600.00$    
Pulverizer, 7' width
Hi-Ranger (describe)
Loader, Articulating, 5-6 cyd 170.00$    1,840.00$    7,280.00$    27,680.00$    
Semi Train - (tractor, dump lead, dump pup) 185.00$    1,665.00$    7,585.00$    29,785.00$    
Screen Deck, 3 Products, 400+TPH
Semi with Dump Lead 160.00$    1,440.00$    6,560.00$    25,760.00$    

 McCormick Sand Inc.
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EQUIPMENT RENTAL


